
 

After more than two months of imple-
mentation issues, outcry, and adjust-
ments, Congress passed the Paycheck 
Protection Program Flexibility Act 
of 2020 (Act) on June 3rd, which was 
signed into law on June 4th. And on 
June 11th, the Small Business Admin-
istration (SBA) published additional 
guidance incorporating provisions of 
the Act into its interim final rules.

The Act addressed a number of 
key shortcomings that the hospitality 
industry found when it tried to take 
advantage of the Paycheck Protection 
Program (PPP) as originally enact-
ed in late March. Chief among them 
was that the PPP required that loan 
proceeds be spent within 8 weeks of 
disbursement in order to be eligible 
for forgiveness - precisely the time-
frame that state economies were put 
into “deep freeze.” Additionally, loan 
proceeds could only be used for a nar-
row band of permitted expenses and 
in prescribed ratios that often didn’t 
align with the needs of the hospital-
ity industry. What follows is a dis-
cussion of how the Act provides key 
flexibility for borrowers that wasn’t 
available originally under the CARES 
Act. Time is of the essence: SBA loan 
numbers for PPP loans must be ob-
tained by June 30th.

Summary of Key Provisions
Loan Maturity Date: The Act ex-

tends the term of the PPP loans (i.e. 
any portion of a PPP loan that is not 
forgiven) from 2 years to 5 years for 
loans made after June 5th, 2020. How-
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Real estate appraisers appraise 
real estate, except that what we really 
value are the rights in real property 
represented by the real estate. But, 
real estate is tangible and generally 
fixed in location. 

There have been some attempts 
to change the traditional role of the 
appraiser performing an inspection of 
a property for valuation purposes. As a 
result, there has been some confusion 
over what an appraiser is inspecting, 
when viewing the subject of a real 
estate appraisal.

One enhancement that has come 
to the forefront has been a hybrid 
appraisal where a third party inspects 
the real estate and provides a report to 
the valuing appraiser. This is a work 
in progress and where some GSE 
interest became apparent in using this 
splitting up of the appraisal process, 
there are some issues that need to be 
straightened out. 

Viewing and inspecting the real 
estate is a critical part of the process. 
A statement in the certification notes 
whether or not we inspected a property 
and the results of the inspection are 
reported in the body of the report.  
Inspecting the property is critical 
for both residential and commercial 
appraisers.  Likewise clients want to 
ensure that properties are adequately 
identified and inspected.

The large issue with third party 
inspections is ascertaining the inspec-
tor’s credibility and the realiability 
of the output from the inspection. 
Another issue is how to handle what 
is essentially “significant” assistance, 
since the inspection is conducted to 
obtain relevant physical characteris-
tics of the subject property.

USPAP defines physical charac-
teristics as “attributes of a property 
that are observable or measurable as 
a matter of fact, as distinguished from 
opinions and conclusions, which are 
the result of some level of analysis or 
judgment.”

The current edition of USPAP 
defines personal inspection as “a 
physical observation performed to 
assist in identifying relevant property 
characteristics in a valuation service.” 
The definition goes on to say:  “An 
appraiser’s inspection is typically 
limited to those things readily ob-
servable without the use of special 
testing or equipment. Appraisals 
of some types of property, such as 
gems and jewelry, may require the 
use of specialized equipment. An 
inspection by an appraiser is not 
the equivalent of an inspection by 
an inspection professional (e.g., a 
structural engineer, home inspector, 
or art conservator).” USPAP has 
provided clarity. 

  Another definition may be helpful: 
Relevant characteristics are “features 
that may affect a property’s value or 
marketability such as legal, econom-
ic, or physical characteristics.” 

This definition suggests that differ-
ent types of properties require differ-
ent approaches to what characteristics 
are relevant in a specific assignment. 
This is a scope of work decision. 
Thus, the relevant characteristics for a 
leased industrial facility are likely to 
differ dramatically from the relevant 
characteristics in an appraisal of a 
single family dwelling. 

Just to be clear, here is the USPAP 
definition of an appraiser: “one who 
is expected to perform valuation ser-
vices competently and in a manner 
that is independent, impartial, and 
objective.” If we really want to split 
the valuation and inspection func-
tions, both are considered valuation 
services and individuals performing 
them must meet requirements of 
competent performance and ethical 
behavior. 

As the Competency Rule of 
USPAP now states: “Perfection is 
impossible to attain, and competence 
does not require perfection. How-
ever, an appraiser must not render 
appraisal services in a careless or 
negligent manner.” Now, more than 
ever, appraisers (and appraisal users) 

need to use due diligence and due 
care and should approach the hy-
bridization of the process carefully 
and with careful consideration of 
consequences, whether expected or 
unexpected. 

Going back to the certification, 
USPAP guides us as follows: “When 
a signing appraiser(s) has relied on 
work done by appraisers and others 
who do not sign the certification, the 
signing appraiser is responsible for 
the decision to rely on their work. The 
signing appraiser(s) is required to 
have a reasonable basis for believing 
that those individuals performing the 
work are competent. The signing 
appraiser(s) also must have no rea-
son to doubt that the work of those 
individuals is credible.” In the hybrid 
environment as envisioned by some, 
there may not be a way to make that 
judgment.

The appraisal profession, in the 
wake of the real estate meltdown in 
the first decade of the new century, 
underwent a reshaping and took a 
good hard look at itself. As a result 
of the difficult times for real estate 
and appraisers, the profession is in 
better shape and has a much higher 
credibility than previously. Eroding 
the credibility of an essential part of 
the appraisal process may streamline 
the process but will create problems 
in the next downturn for appraisers, 
users, and for public trust.

Bill Pastuszek, MAI, ASA, MRA heads 
Shepherd Associates, Newton Mass.

Another definition may be helpful: Relevant character-
istics are “features that may affect a property’s value 
or marketability such as legal, economic, or physical 
characteristics.”
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Paycheck Protection Program Flexibility Act –
Needed changes to CARES Act

ever, the Act will not prohibit lenders 
and borrowers from mutually agree-
ing to modify the maturity terms of 
a covered loan, so existing borrowers 
are free to negotiate longer loan terms 
as well. The date that a PPP loan is 
“made” is the date that the SBA as-
signs a loan number to the PPP, not 
necessarily the date of disbursal of 
funds.

Deadline to Use the Loan Pro-
ceeds: The Act extends the “covered 
period” with respect to loan forgive-
ness from the original 8 week period 
after the loan disbursement to the ear-
lier of 24 weeks after disbursement or 
December 31st, 2020. This means that 
businesses that were unable to open 
and spend the loan proceeds within 
the original timeframe now have up 
to three times as long to do so. Cur-
rent borrowers who received loans 
prior to the enactment of the Act may 
nevertheless elect the shorter 8 week 
period.

Forgivable Uses of the Loan Pro-
ceeds: The Act raises the cap on the 
amount of forgivable loan proceeds 
borrowers may use on non-payroll 
expenses from 25% to 40%. The Act 
does not affect existing PPP rules re-
stricting borrowers’ use of proceeds 
to eligible expenses: Payroll and ben-
efits; interest (but not principal) on 
mortgages or other existing debt; rent; 
and utilities. While the Act, as drafted, 
can be interpreted to treat spending 
60% of the loan proceeds on payroll 
expenses as a threshold requirement 
to applying for any forgiveness, the 
SBA’s June 11th rules confirm that 
60% refers to proportion, not thresh-
old. Therefore, a borrower who gets 
a loan of $1 million but only spends 
$500,000 on payroll can still apply for 
loan forgiveness, but the maximum 
forgivable amount will be reduced to 
$833,333.33 (because the $500,000 

spent on payroll must reflect 60% of 
the maximum forgivable amount).

Safe Harbor for Rehiring Work-
ers: Loan forgiveness under the
PPP remains subject to reduction
in proportion to any reduction in a 
borrower’s full-time equivalent em-
ployees (FTEs) against prior staffing 
level benchmarks. The Act extends 
the PPP’s existing safe harbor dead-
line to December 31ST, 2020: Bor-
rowers who lost workers can avoid 
reduction of loan forgiveness due to 
reduced FTE count as long as they re-
store their FTEs by the deadline.

New Exemptions from Rehiring 
Workers: The Act also adds two ex-
emptions to the PPP’s loan forgive-
ness reduction penalties. Firstly, the 
forgiveness amount will not be re-
duced due to a reduced FTE count if 
the borrower can document that they 
attempted, but were unable, to rehire 
individuals who had been employees 
on February 15th, 2020 (this codifies a 
previous SBA FAQ answer) and have 
been unable to hire “similarly quali-
fied employees” before December 
31st, 2020. Secondly, the forgiveness 
will not be reduced due to a reduced 
FTE count if the borrower can docu-
ment, in good faith, an inability to re-
turn to the “same level of business ac-
tivity” as prior to February 15th, 2020 
due to compliance with legal require-
ments for sanitation, social distanc-
ing, and worker or customer safety.

We note that this second exemption 
as drafted applies only to businesses 
whose activity is stunted due to legal 
compliance with safety protocols.
It is not a blanket exemption for all 
businesses. For example, a restaurant 
forced to cut its dining room capacity 
by 50% to space tables apart might get 
the exemption, but its linen supplier 
wouldn’t, even if the supplier’s orders 
also dropped by 50%, since the linen 
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supplier’s business isn’t affected by 
its own legal compliance, only that of 
the restaurant. Of course, the outcome 
is different if the linen supplier has 
outsized compliance issues of its own 
that cause its business to fall.

Loan Deferral Period: The Act 
extends the loan deferral period from 
an original range of 6 to 12 months, 
to (a) the date the amount of loan for-
giveness is remitted to the lender (or 
the borrower’s forgiveness applica-
tion is rejected) or (b) 10 months after 
the forgiveness covered period, if a 
borrower does not apply for forgive-
ness during that 10 month period.

Payroll Tax Deferral: The Act lifts 
the ban on borrowers whose loans 
were partially or completely forgiv-
en from deferring payment of payroll 
taxes. The payroll tax deferral is now 
open to all PPP borrowers.

Summary: The Act provides
much-needed flexibility to the hos-
pitality industry to address the short-
comings of the initial PPP.  As with 
the initial rollout of the PPP, it will be 
up to the Department of the Treasury 
and the SBA to provide additional 
regulations, and we expect addition-
al guidance to be forthcoming as the 
first wave of forgiveness applications 
is processed. 

Sherin and Lodgen’s Hospitality 
Practice Group continues to follow 
the PPP closely.

Joshua Bowman is a lawyer from 
the Boston law firm of Sherin and 
Lodgen LLP.  Bowman is the chair of 
the firm’s hospitality practice group 
and is a well-known hospitality at-
torney.

Joseph Wang is a partner at  Sher-
in and Lodgen LLP in the Real Estate 
Department and is a member of the 
hospitality practice group.




